‘.. PARLIAMENT OF THE DEMOCRATIC
| SOCIALIST REPUBLIC OF
SRI. LANKA

EXCISE (AMENDMENT)
ACT, No. 37 OF 1990

[Certified on 11th October, 19901

Printed on the Orders of Government

P Pubhshed as a Supplement to Part 11 of the Gazette of the Democratlc
Soclahst Republic of Sri Lanka of October 12, 1990

PIEJ}'.'TED AT THE DEPARTMENT OF GOVERNMINT PRINTING, SRI LANKA

" T0 BX PURCHASED AT THF GOVERNMENT PUBLICATIONS BUREAU, COLOMEOQ

j¢ 160 cents. | ' Postage : Re, 1.00 |

Lot
PR
FE i e e e N



L
e SR

.

Excise (Amendment) Act, No. 37 of 1990
[Certified on 11th October, 1090.]

L.D—O 33/89 |

Ax Act TO AMEND THE EXCISE ORDINANCE

BE it enacted by the Parliament of-thé Democratic Socialist
Republic of Sri Lanka as follows :—

1. This Act may be cited as the Excise (Amendmen{) Act,

No. 37 of 1930.

9. Section 32 of the Excise Ordinance (hereinafter
referred to as © the principal enactment ) is hereby amended
as follows :—

(1) in paragraph (p) of subsection (2) of that section by
the substitution for the words “to be used there-
with. ”, of the words “to be used therewith ;” ; and

(2) by the addition at the end of subsection (2) of that
section of the following new paragraph : —

¢ (g) prescribing a scheme for the payment of re-
wards to excise officers and informers, out of
the Reward Fund established under section
58a.%.

3. Section 35 of the principal enactment is hereby
amended in subsection (2) of that section as follows :—

{1) by the substitution, for the words “fifty rupees ? of
the words “ five thousand rupees” ; and

(2) by the substitution, for the words “ six weeks ”, of the
words * two months ”, :

4. Section 46 of the principal enactment is hereby
amended by the substitution for all the words from ¢ shall

. be guilty ” to “so continued ” of the words “shall be guilty
- of an offence, and be liable on conviction— :

(i) in the case of an offence referred to in paragraph (a),
(c), (@), (e), (), (g) or (k) to imprisonment of
either description for a term which may extend to
one year or to a fine which may extend fo one
hundred thousand rupees, or to both such imprison-
ment and fine, and where the act hereby penalised
is continued after conviction he shall be liable to
a further fine of ten thousand rupees for each day
during which the offence is so continued ; and

- 2D 008TE4—T,130 (90/04)

Short title.

Atmendment

0
section 32 of
Chapter 52.

Amendment

Amendment

of

gection 46 of
the principal
enactment.




2, Excise (Amendment) Act, No. 37 of 1990

{(ii) in the case of an 6ifence referred to in paragraph (b) |

to imprisonment of either description for a term not
less than six months and not exceeding five years
or to afine which may extend to one hundred
thousand rupees or to both such imprisonment and
fine and where the act hereby penalised is continued
after conviction he shall be liable to a further fine
of fifteen thousand rupees for each day during
which the offence is so continued.”.

5. Section 47 of the principal enactment is hereby
amended in subsection (1) of that section, as follows :—

(1) by the substitution, for the words “six months”, of
the words * one year” ; and

(2) by the substitution, for the words “one thousand

rupees,”, of the words “one hundred thousand
Tupees, ”.

6. Section 48 of the principal enactment is hereby
amended by the substitution, for the words “two hundred
rupees, ”, of the words “five thousand rupees,”, '

Y

7. Section 50 of the principal enactment is hereby
amended by the substitution, for the words “one hundred
rupees, ”, of the words “ten thousand Tpees, .

8. Section 56 of the principél enactment is hereby
amended by the substitution, for the words “ one thousand
rupees, ”, of the words “five hundred thousand rupees, 7.

9. The following new section is hereby inserted imme-
diately after section 58, and shall have effect as section 58a
of the principal enactment :-—

;{Exciée 58A. (1) There shall be established a Fund
Fﬁg;. rd to be called the Excise Reward Fund (in this

section referred to as “the Fund’) which

Amendment
of section 47
ol the
principal
enactment.

Amendment
of section 48
of the
principal
enactment. -

Amwendment
of section 50
of_the
principal
enactment.
Amendment
of section. 56
of the
principal
enactment, .

Insertion ¢of
new gection
884 in
principal
enactment.

shall be wunder the control of the Excise _

Commissioner.

" (2) There shall be paid into the Fund all
sums of money, received under section 56,
in composition of offences committed under
this Ordinance or in lieu of cancellation or
suspension of a licence, permit or pass issued’

under this Ordinance.
ke

i
3
L
z.
1
!



Excise (Amendment) Act, No. 37 of 1990 3

(3) There shall be paid out of the Fund,
all payments required to be made as rewards
to excise officers and informers, in
accordance with the scheme prescribed by
rules made under section 32..

10. In the event of any inconsistency between the Sinhala
and Tamil texts of this Act, the Sinhala text shall prevail.

. !' R [ Coes TIwe L or e Loyt : } e .
ERR R E R SR R P B e T
AR S B RS . v IR TR

Sinhala text
to prevailin
case of.
inconsistency.



L - N

Ve Annual subscription of English Bills and Acts of the Parliament Rs. 885 (Local),

Rs. 1,180 (Foreign), payable to the SUPERINTENDENT, GOVERNMENT PUBLICATIONS

Bureavu, CoLomso 1, before 15th December each year in respect of the year
following, . .

3



