
PUBLIC  SERVICE  PROVIDENT  FUND
(AMENDMENT)  ACT,  No.45  OF 1999

PARLIAMENT  OF  THE  DEMOCRATIC
SOCIALIST  REPUBLIC  OF

SRI  LANKA

[Certified on 10th December, 1999]

Printed on the Order of Government

Published as a Supplement to Part II of the Gazette of the Democratic
Socialist Republic of Sri Lanka of December  10, 1999.

PRINTED  AT  THE  DEPARTMENT  OF  GOVERNMENT  PRINTING,  SRI  LANKA

TO  BE  PURCHASED  AT  THE  GOVERNMENT  PUBLICATIONS  BUREAU, COLOMBO 1

Price : Rs.3.50 Postage : Rs. 3.50

(Internet Version)



1Public Service Provident Fund (Amendment)
Act, No.45 of 1999

Short title.

Amendment of
section 4 of the
principal
enactment.

[Certified on 10th December, 1999]

L.D.–O.12/95.

AN ACT  TO AMEND THE PUBLIC SERVICE PROVIDENT FUND

ORDINANCE

BE it enacted by the Parliament of  the Democratic Socialist
Republic of  Sri Lanka as follows  :–

1. This Act may be cited as the Public Service Provident
Fund (Amendment) Act, No.45 of 1999.

2. Section 2 of the Public Service Provident Fund Ordinance
(hereinafter referred to as the “Principal enactment”) is hereby
amended by the insertion immediately after subsection (4) of
that section, of the following subsection :–

“(4A) for the purposes of this Ordinance, a person who
holds –

(a) the  post  of  Sub - Station  Master  in  the  Railway
  Department; or.

(b) a post in the Sri Lanka Police Reserve,

shall be deemed to be a non-pensionable employee in the
service of the Government and the monthly allowance paid in
lieu of salary to such person shall be deemed to be a  monthly
salary”.

3.   Section 4 of the principal enactment is hereby
amended as follows:–

(a) in subsection (1) of that section, by the substitution,
for the words “ six  per centum”, of  the words “eight
per centum” ; and

(b) in the proviso to subsection (2) of  that section by the
substitution, for the words “six per centum”, of the
words “eight per centum”. ;

H-022545

Amendment of
section 2 of
Chapter 434.



2 Public Service Provident Fund (Amendment)
Act, No.45 of 1999

Amendment of
section  5 of the
principal
enactment.

Retrospective
effect and
validation.

4. Section 5 of the principal enactment is hereby amended

by the substitution for the words “six per centum”, of the words
“eight per centum”.

5. (1) The amendment made to the principal enactment by

section 2 of this Act, shall –

(a) insofar  as such amendment relates to a person holding
the post of Sub-Station Master in the Railway
Department, be deemed for all purposes to have come
into force on May 1, 1983 and the compulsory
contribution deducted from the salary of any such
person and paid to the fund during the period between
May 01, 1983 and the date of commencement of this
Act, shall be deemed to have been validly deducted
and paid;

(b) insofar as such amendment relates to a person holding
a  post in the Sri Lanka Police Reserve be deemed for
all purposes to have come into force on January 01,
1991 and the compulsory contribution deducted from
the salary of any such person and paid to the fund
during the period between January 01, 1991 and the
date of commencement of  this Act shall be deemed to
have been validly deducted and paid.

(2) The amendment to section 4 of the principal enactment
made by section 3 of this Act, shall be deemed for all purposes
to have come into force on January 01, 1995 and the amounts
deducted from the salaries of non- pensionable employees and
paid to the fund between January 01, 1995 and the date of
commencement of this Act, at the rates specified in such section
as so amended,  shall be deemed to have been validly deducted
and paid.

6. In the event of any inconsistency between the Sinhala
and Tamil texts of this Act, the Sinhala text shall prevail.

Sinhala text to
prevail in case of
any inconsistency.



Annual subscription of  English Bills and Acts of the Parliament Rs. 885 (Local), Rs. 1,180 (Foreign),

payable to the SUPERINTENDENT, GOVERNMENT PUBLICATIONS BUREAU, No. 32,TRANSWORKS HOUSE,

LOTUS ROAD, COLOMBO 01 before 15th  December each year in respect of the year  following.


