
I fldgi ( ^I& fPoh - YS% ,xld m%cd;dka;s%l iudcjd§ ckrcfha w;s úfYI .eiÜ m;%h - 2018'03'06
PART I : SEC. (I) - GAZETTE   EXTRAORDINARY   OF   THE   DEMOCRATIC   SOCIALIST   REPUBLIC   OF   SRI  LANKA 06.03.2018

1A

w;s úfYI

wxl 2061$12 - 2018 ud¾;= ui 06 jeks wÕyrejdod - 2018'03'06
No. 2061/12  - TUESDAY,  MARCH  06, 2018

EXTRAORDINARY
The Gazette of the Democratic Socialist Republic of Sri Lanka

(Published by Authority)

PART I : SECTION (I) — GENERAL
Government  Notifications

Y%S ,xld m%cd;dka;%sl iudcjd§ ckrcfha .eiÜ m;%h

This Gazette Extraordinary can be downloaded from www.documents.gov.lk

                  
       

              
               
            

        
                  

     
         
             
         

               
            

               
               

            
               

        
                 

        
              
               
            

         
                  

1A  - G  27236 — 08 (03/2018)

L.D.B. 132/ 29 (ii)

PUBLIC   SERVICE   MUTUAL   PROVIDENT   ASSOCIATION   ORDINANCE

RULES made by the Public Sevice Mutual Provident Association under Section 16 of the Public Service Mutual Provident
Association Ordinance (Chapter 283) and approved by the Minister of Finance.

Secretary,
Ministry of  Finance and Mass Media.

Colombo,
20th February  2018.

Rules

The rules published in Gazette No. 5147 dated 17th June 1892 as amended as from time to time and last amended
by Extraordinary Gazette No. 1777/ 38 dated 28th September 2012 are hereby further amended as follows :-

1. Under the heading Chapter 1- General Rules

(a) in rule 6 -

(1) the paragraph (i) of sub rule (A) is hereby rescinded and the following paragraph is substituted
therefore :-

‘’Any member who has retired from the State Service, Provincial State Service, Local Government
Service as a per a retirement scheme of Government, on abolition of office resign or is dismissed
from his post under Section 7 (A) or ceased to be a member under the provision 7 (B) (i) shall be
requested to set off every loan or advance obtained under the rules No. 12 and 13 and any balance of
the property loan obtained under Chapter II. This shall consist of total contribution fee, the interest



I fldgi ( ^I& fPoh - YS% ,xld m%cd;dka;s%l iudcjd§ ckrcfha w;s úfYI .eiÜ m;%h - 2018'03'06
PART I : SEC. (I) - GAZETTE   EXTRAORDINARY   OF   THE   DEMOCRATIC   SOCIALIST   REPUBLIC   OF   SRI  LANKA 06.03.2018

2A

and balance amount if any. When request is made the interest shall be charged by calculating up to
the last date requested for the setting off the loan”.

(2) the paragraph (ii) of subrule (A) is hereby rescinded and the following paragraph is substituted
therefor :-

“Any member who is requested to set off the contributory fee and the interest credited to him for
the property loan and obtained under the rules No. 12 and 13 and set off as provided for rule 6(A)(i)
may remain as a donatory member if he is consented to pay donator membership fee. He may be
able to get new membership if he is willing to pay membership fee in addition to loan. However, he
may be considered as a new member when granting a salary loan under the rule 13(i)”.

(b) in rule 13 -

(1) in the table thereof, in corresponding entry of item 6 of Column II loan entitlements chart, by the
substitution for the word and figures “Rs. 80,000/-” of the word and figures “Rs. 90,000/-” ;

(2) in rule 13(A), by the substitution for the word and figures “Rs. 7,500/-” for the word and figures
“Rs. 10,000/-” ;

(3) any member who has not completed five years of government service he may obtain this loan on the
guarantee of a member who has completed five years or any two members who are permanent in
their service.

(4) (i) in rule 13(B) by the substitution for words and figures “Rs. 50,000.00” of the words and
figures “Rs. 100,000.00”

(ii) by the substitution for the word “6 months” of the word “03 months” ;

(5) in rule 13(D) by the substitution for the word and figures “Rs. 50,000” of the word and figures “Rs.
100,000.00” ;

(6) in rule 13(K)

(i) in paragraph (i) thereof, by the substitution for the words “A special advance of rupees ten
thousand ” of the words

“A special advance of maximum amount of rupees twenty five thousand” ;

(ii) by the addition immediately after paragraph (ii) of the rule 13(K), of the following new
paragraphs :-

“ (iii) to grant a loan of Rs. 100,000/- to a member who is following a Postgraduate Degree (MA,
MPhill, MSc). This loan shall be repaid in 60 equal monthly installments, at the interest rate
10% per annum, subject to a maximum deduction limit of 40% of his monthly salary” ;

(iv) any member who is permanent in office or recruited to a permanent post subject to a probation
period, may be granted a maximum amount of Rs. 200,000/- loan to purchase a motor cycle
with the conditions imposed by the Committee of Management on repayment in 30 equal
monthly installments at the interest rate of 12% per annum ;

(v) for the loans granted under paragraph (iv), any member who has not completed five years of
government service he may obtain this loan on the guarantee of a member who has completed
five years or any two members who are permanent in their service.



I fldgi ( ^I& fPoh - YS% ,xld m%cd;dka;s%l iudcjd§ ckrcfha w;s úfYI .eiÜ m;%h - 2018'03'06
PART I : SEC. (I) - GAZETTE   EXTRAORDINARY   OF   THE   DEMOCRATIC   SOCIALIST   REPUBLIC   OF   SRI  LANKA 06.03.2018

3A

(c)  in rule 14(3)-

(1) the paragraph (i) is hereby rescinded and the following paragraph is substituted therefor :

“(i) A donation of rupees 55,000/- shall be paid to any member who have fulfilled the requirements
mentioned in the paragraph (ii) and (iii) and have more than five years of membership” ;

(2) the paragraph (iv) of is hereby rescinded and the following paragraph is substituted therefor :-

“(iv)  It shall be lawful to establish a fund known as “Medical Donation Fund” to which every member
of the Association should credit rupees 25/- monthly ” ;

(3) by the insertion immediately after paragraph (vi) of rule thereof of the following new paragraph :-

“(vii) the increased Rs. 7,500/- of the amount granted for Refractive Lence Exchange Surgery up to
Rs. 10,000/- ” ;

(d) by the insertion immediately after the rule 15(ii), of the following new paragraph :-

“(iii) (a) the Members of Public Service Mutual Provident Association are entitled to a retirement
allowance. The Payment of retirement allowance at the retirement will be effective from the
date 01.01.2015.”

(a) a member who has retired from Rs. 10,000/-
01.01.2015 to 31.12.2015

(b) a member who has retired from Rs. 12,000/-
01.01.2016 to 31.12.2016

(c) a member who has retired from Rs. 14,000/-
01.01.2017 to 31.12.2017

(d) a member who has retired on or Rs. 15,000/-
after 01.08.2018

(b) by every member who is in service shall pay a fee of Rs. 20/- as a contribution and it shall be
deducted from such number from 01.01.2014.

(e) in rule 17-

(1) the paragraph (1) of rule (17) is hereby repealed

(2) by the renumbering of rule 17(ii) as 17(i) ;

(3) by the insertion immediately after the rule 17(i), of the following new rules :-

“(ii) interest mentioned in the relevant rule shall be recovered by calculating the amount
proportionately to the number of days from the date of payment of the loan up to the due date
of payment ;

(iii) Committee of Management has the power to amend the interest rate for the loans and the
interest granted by the Association taking into consideration the fluctuating interest rates of
the Government and the market subject to the concurrence of the Deputy Secretary to the
Treasury.



I fldgi ( ^I& fPoh - YS% ,xld m%cd;dka;s%l iudcjd§ ckrcfha w;s úfYI .eiÜ m;%h - 2018'03'06
PART I : SEC. (I) - GAZETTE   EXTRAORDINARY   OF   THE   DEMOCRATIC   SOCIALIST   REPUBLIC   OF   SRI  LANKA 06.03.2018

4A

(iv) Interest for the loans obtained from the Association shall be paid on diminishing balance as at
each month at the interest rate specified under the relevant rule. If interest rate has not been
specified for a loan under any rule, interest of 8% per annum shall be charged for such loan.” ;

(f) by the substitution in rule 19 for the words “the interest so accumulated” of the words “the loan so
accumulated”.

(g)  by the insertion immediately after the paragraph (iii) of rule 25 of the following new paragraph :-

(iv) A member shall complete five years of active membership to qualify for nomination as a member of
the Committee of Management. Every deduction shall be deducted from the salary or pension of
the Nominee, Proposer and Seconder for continuous six months prior to the date of closing date
for calling the nominations for election to the Committee of Management, if any member is to be
retired within six months, membership shall be updated by payment of fees”.

(2) Under the heading Chapter II -

(a) paragraph (i) of rule 5 is hereby rescinded and the following paragraph is substituted therefor :-

“The interest charged for the first of Rs. 300,000/- of the amount approved by the Committee of
Management for property loan shall be 10% per annum and the interest charged for the balance amount
shall be 12% per annum.” ;

(b) by the renumbering of rule 6 as rule 6(1) ;

(c) by the insertion immediately after the renumbered paragraph (i) of rule 6 of the following new
paragraph :-

“(i) Where a property loan is applied for a second time within the maximum time period after obtaining
a property loan can approval report shall be obtained by conducting a inspection for the mortgaged
property if the value mentioned in the previous assessment report is exceeding the aggregate of the
balance amount of the previous loan an second loan amount, if the assessment report is more than 2
years old and value mentioned in the first assessment report exceeds the above aggregate assessment,
an approval shall be needed.” .

(d) the paragraph (i) of rule 10 is hereby rescinded and the following paragraph is substituted therefor :-

“(i) The loan shall be repaid in 300 monthly installments or before exceeding 80 years of age at the date
whichever comes first”.

(e) paragraph (v) of rule 6A is hereby rescinded and the following paragraph is substituted therefor :-

“(v) An additonal fee of 0.5% shall be charged for prevalling balance of the loan to the last date of
recovering the loan balance, whenever the property loan is recovered under the rule 6A (1)”

(3) Under the heading Chapter IV

(a) paragraph 4 of the thereof is hereby rescinded and the following paragraph is substituted therefor :-

“4. Any employee shall obtain a loan not exceeding rupees 4,000/- for purchasing books and stationary
for his children” ;



I fldgi ( ^I& fPoh - YS% ,xld m%cd;dka;s%l iudcjd§ ckrcfha w;s úfYI .eiÜ m;%h - 2018'03'06
PART I : SEC. (I) - GAZETTE   EXTRAORDINARY   OF   THE   DEMOCRATIC   SOCIALIST   REPUBLIC   OF   SRI  LANKA 06.03.2018

5A

(b) paragraph 5 of the thereof is hereby rescinded and the following paragraph is substituted thereof  :

“5. An employee shall obtain a loan not exceeding rupees 10,000/-  as a festival advance.”

(c) by the insertion immediately after the paragraph 5 thereof, of the following new item :

“Computer Loan

6. An employee may be granted a loan not exceeding of rupees 75,000/- for purchasing a computer.

(i) The loan shall be repaid in 50 monthly installments an interest is ten per centum (10%) ;

(ii) An officer or employee with a service of five years, is eligible for this loan ;

(iii) If any employee has less than 5 years of service, two guarantors with more than five years of service are
required ;

(iv) If a period of service of any employee on completion of 55 years of age is less than 100 calendar months,
a declaration stating that the payment of the balance shall be recovered from his gratuity shall be given ;

(v) A 40% of his salary limit shall be applicable.

(d) by the renumbering of paragraphs 6 and 7 as paragraphs 7 and 8 respectively

03-805

PRINTED AT THE DEPARTMENT OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, SRI LANKA.



<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /None
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Error
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Tags
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.0000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /CMYK
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams false
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize true
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments true
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts true
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Apply
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue false
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages true
  /ColorImageMinResolution 300
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleColorImages true
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 300
  /ColorImageDepth -1
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /DCTEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages true
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages true
  /GrayImageMinResolution 300
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleGrayImages true
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 300
  /GrayImageDepth -1
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /DCTEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages true
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages true
  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleMonoImages true
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 1200
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck false
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly false
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError true
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile ()
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier ()
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName ()
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /CreateJDFFile false
  /Description <<

    /BGR <>
    /CHS <FEFF4f7f75288fd94e9b8bbe5b9a521b5efa7684002000410064006f006200650020005000440046002065876863900275284e8e9ad88d2891cf76845370524d53705237300260a853ef4ee54f7f75280020004100630072006f0062006100740020548c002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e003000204ee553ca66f49ad87248672c676562535f00521b5efa768400200050004400460020658768633002>
    /CHT <FEFF4f7f752890194e9b8a2d7f6e5efa7acb7684002000410064006f006200650020005000440046002065874ef69069752865bc9ad854c18cea76845370524d5370523786557406300260a853ef4ee54f7f75280020004100630072006f0062006100740020548c002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e003000204ee553ca66f49ad87248672c4f86958b555f5df25efa7acb76840020005000440046002065874ef63002>
    /CZE <>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ESP <>
    /ETI <>
    /FRA <>
    /GRE <>

    /HRV (Za stvaranje Adobe PDF dokumenata najpogodnijih za visokokvalitetni ispis prije tiskanja koristite ove postavke.  Stvoreni PDF dokumenti mogu se otvoriti Acrobat i Adobe Reader 5.0 i kasnijim verzijama.)
    /HUN <>
    /ITA <>
    /JPN <FEFF9ad854c18cea306a30d730ea30d730ec30b951fa529b7528002000410064006f0062006500200050004400460020658766f8306e4f5c6210306b4f7f75283057307e305930023053306e8a2d5b9a30674f5c62103055308c305f0020005000440046002030d530a130a430eb306f3001004100630072006f0062006100740020304a30883073002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e003000204ee5964d3067958b304f30533068304c3067304d307e305930023053306e8a2d5b9a306b306f30d530a930f330c8306e57cb30818fbc307f304c5fc59808306730593002>
    /KOR <FEFFc7740020c124c815c7440020c0acc6a9d558c5ec0020ace0d488c9c80020c2dcd5d80020c778c1c4c5d00020ac00c7a50020c801d569d55c002000410064006f0062006500200050004400460020bb38c11cb97c0020c791c131d569b2c8b2e4002e0020c774b807ac8c0020c791c131b41c00200050004400460020bb38c11cb2940020004100630072006f0062006100740020bc0f002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e00300020c774c0c1c5d0c11c0020c5f40020c2180020c788c2b5b2c8b2e4002e>
    /LTH <>
    /LVI <>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken die zijn geoptimaliseerd voor prepress-afdrukken van hoge kwaliteit. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 5.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /POL <>
    /PTB <>
    /RUM <>
    /RUS <>
    /SKY <>
    /SLV <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /TUR <>
    /UKR <>
    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents best suited for high-quality prepress printing.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 5.0 and later.)
  >>
  /Namespace [
    (Adobe)
    (Common)
    (1.0)
  ]
  /OtherNamespaces [
    <<
      /AsReaderSpreads false
      /CropImagesToFrames true
      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue
      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false
      /IncludeGuidesGrids false
      /IncludeNonPrinting false
      /IncludeSlug false
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (InDesign)
        (4.0)
      ]
      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false
      /OmitPlacedEPS false
      /OmitPlacedPDF false
      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy
    >>
    <<
      /AddBleedMarks false
      /AddColorBars false
      /AddCropMarks false
      /AddPageInfo false
      /AddRegMarks false
      /ConvertColors /ConvertToCMYK
      /DestinationProfileName ()
      /DestinationProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /Downsample16BitImages true
      /FlattenerPreset <<
        /PresetSelector /MediumResolution
      >>
      /FormElements false
      /GenerateStructure false
      /IncludeBookmarks false
      /IncludeHyperlinks false
      /IncludeInteractive false
      /IncludeLayers false
      /IncludeProfiles false
      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (CreativeSuite)
        (2.0)
      ]
      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /PreserveEditing true
      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UntaggedRGBHandling /UseDocumentProfile
      /UseDocumentBleed false
    >>
  ]
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]
>> setpagedevice


