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EXTRAORDINARY 

THE LAND ACQUISITION ACT (CHAPTER 460) 
 

Notice under Section 7  
                                                                                            

My Ref. No.: DS/GFG/L&L/5/88. 
Ministry of Land and Parliamentary Reforms Ref No.:  

4 - 3/11/2016/UD/73. 
  

I hereby give notice under Sub-Section (1) of Section 7, 
of Land Acquisition Act, No. 28 of 1964 (Amendment) 
that the Government intends to acquire the following land 
which is required for a public purpose: 
 

Nine (9) allotments of land in total extent 0.0456 Hectare 
depicted as Lot No. 1, 2, 3, 4, 5, 6, 7, 8, & 9   in Preliminary 
Plan No. 4348 prepared by the Surveyor General situated 
in the Village of Dangedara West in the Dangedara West 
Division No. 98D of Municipal Council limit of Galle in 
the Divisional Secretary’s Division of Four Gravets Galle 
in Galle District of the Southern Province and bounded as 
follows: 
 

Schedule 
01. Lot No. 01 
Name of the land: Not stated; Description: Road; 

Claimant : State; Original Claimant : In need of the 
development of Donaled Jany cross canal of Moragoda 
Canal; Extent: About 0.0028 hectare.                                                                                                                                                                                                                         

02. Lot No. 02 
Name of the land: Not stated; Description: Road; 

Claimant: State; Original Claimant: Could not be traced; 
Extent: About 0.0256 hectare. 

 
03. Lot No. 03 
Name of the land: Not stated; Description: Drain; 

Claimant: State; Original Claimant: Could not be traced; 
Extent: About 0.0001 hectare 

 
04. Lot No. 04 
Name of the land: Not stated; Description: Road; 

Claimant: State; Original Claimant: Could not be traced; 
Extent: About 0.0086 hectare. 

 
05. Lot No. 05 
Name of the land: Could not be traced; Description: 

Garden; Claimant: State; Original Claimant: Mahinda 
College, Galle; Extent: About 0.0028 hectare. 

 
06. Lot No. 06 
Name of the land: Not stated; Description: Road; 

Claimant: State; Original Claimant: Could not be traced; 
Extent : About 0.0044 hectare. 

 
07. Lot No. 07 
Name of the land: Could not be traced; Description: 

Garden; Claimant: State; Original Claimant: Could not be 
traced; Extent: About 0.0008 hectare. 
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08. Lot No. 08 
Name of the land: Could not be traced; Description: 

Garden; Claimant: State; Original Claimant: Could not be 
traced; Extent: About 0.0002 hectare. 

 
09. Lot No. 09 
Name of the land: Could not be traced; Description: 

Garden; Claimant: State; Original Claimant: Could not be 
traced; Extent : about 0.0003 hectare. 

 
All persons interested in the aforesaid lands are hereby 

required to appear personally or by agents duly authorized 
in writing before me at the  Four Gravets Galle, Divisional 
Secretariat on 06.06.2018 at 9.00 a.m. and are hereby 
requested to notify to me in writing (in duplicate) on or 
before 30.05.2018 the nature of their interest in the land, 
the particulars of their claims for compensation for the 
acquisition of the said lands, the amount of compensation 
and the details of the computation of such amount. 

 
All deeds and documents in support of the claims 

should be produced before me at the inquiry. 
 
 W.S. Sathyananda, 
 Divisional Secretary, 
 Divisional Secretary's Division,  
 Four Gravets Galle. 
 

Divisional Secretariat, 
Four Gravets Galle, 
 
06-597/1 

 
 

 
 

THE LAND ACQUISITION (CHAPTER 460) 
 

Notice under Section 7  
                                                                                         

My Ref. No.: DS/GFG/L&L/5/88. 
Ministry of Land and Parliamentary reforms Ref No.:  

4 - 3/11/2016/UD/73. 
  

I hereby give notice under Sub - section (1) of Section 7, 
of Land Acquisition Act that the Government intends to 
acquire the following land which is required for a public 
purpose. 

 

Two (02) allotments of land in total extent 0.0021 
Hectare depicted as Lot No. 408 & 410 in the Sheet 
No.03 of Block No. 01 in Cadastral Map No. 810025 
prepared by the Surveyor General situated in the Village 
of  Dangedara East in the Grama Niladhari Division No. 
97D of Dangedara East in the Municipal Council limit of 
Galle in the Divisional Secretary’s Division of Four 
Gravets Galle in Galle District of the Southern Province 
and bounded as follows: 

 
Schedule 

01. Lot No. 408 
Name of the land : Kuruduwatta pashaul ovita, Pashaul 

ovita alias Kuruduwatta addara Mahaliyadda and 
Kukulane ovita, Assessment Number 394/3A, Hiribura 
Road; Description: Garden; Claimant: State; Original 
Claimant: Dangedara East, Hiribura Road, 394/3A, 
Ukwatta Hodamuni Dhanika Thilanka De Soysa And 
Singappulige Ariyabadrani Perera; Extent: About 0.0001 
Hectare. 

 
02. Lot No. 410 
Name of the land: Kuruduwatta Pashaul ovita, Pashaul 

ovita alias Kuruduwatta addara Mahaliyadda and 
Kukulane ovita, Assessment Number 394/1, Hiribura 
Road; Description: Garden; Claimant: State; Original 
Claimant: Dangedara East, Hiribura Road, 394/1, Kumara 
Pradeep deegala and others; Extent : about 0.0020 
hectare. 

 
All persons interested in the aforesaid lands are hereby 

required to appear personally or by agents duly 
authorized in writing before me at the  Four Gravets 
Galle, Divisional Secretariat on 06.06.2018 at 9.00 a.m. 
and are hereby requested to notify to me in writing (in 
duplicate) on or before 30.05.2018 the nature of their 
interest in the land, the particulars of their claims for 
compensation for the acquisition of the said lands, the 
amount of compensation and the details of the 
computation of such amount. 

 
All deeds and documents in support of the claims 

should be produced before me at the inquiry. 
 

 W.S. Sathyananda, 
 Divisional Secretary, 
 Divisional Secretary's Division,  
 Four Gravets Galle. 
 

Divisional Secretariat, 
Four Gravets Galle. 
 
06-597/2 
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THE LAND ACQUISITION ACT (CHAPTER 460) 
  

Notice under Section 7  
                                                                                             

                                     My Ref. No.: DS/GFG/L&L/5/88. 
Ministry of Land and Parliamentary reforms Ref No.:  

4 - 3/11/2016/UD/73. 
  

I hereby give notice under Sub - section (1) of Section 7, 
of Land Acquisition Act that the Government intends to 
acquire the following land which is required for a public 
purpose. 
 
Six (06) allotments of land in total extent 0.1262 Hectare 
depicted as Lot No. 201, 203, 206, 207, 210 & 211 in the 
Sheet No. 03 of Block No. 03 in Cadastral Map No. 
810023 prepared by the Surveyor General situated in the 
Village of Madawalamulla South in the Grama Niladhari 
Division No. 98 of Madawalamulla South in the 
Municipal Council limit of Galle in the Divisional 
Secretary’s Division of Four Gravets Galle in Galle 
District of the Southern Province and bounded as follows: 
 

Schedule 
01. Lot No. 201 
Name of the land: Could not be traced; Description: 

Garden; Claimant: State; Original Claimant: Could not be 
traced; Extent: About 0.0928 Hectare. 

 
02. Lot No. 203 
Name of the land: Kuruduwatta Ovita, Kuruduwatta 

addara alials Wela addara kumbura, Assessment Number 
could not be traced; Description: Garden; Claimant: State; 
Original Claimant: Madawalamulla South, Hiribura Road, 
Indika Manoj Vijayapala;Extent : About 0.0105 Hectare. 

 
03. Lot No. 206 
Name of the land : Could not be traced; Description: 

Garden; Claimant: State; Original Claimant: Could not be 
traced; Extent: About 0.0152 Hectare. 

 
04. Lot No. 207 
Name of the land: Kurudugahawatta Pashawala 

Ovita,Pashawala Ovita alias Kuruduwatta addara 
Mahaliyadda Kukulane ovita, Assessment Number 
394A/1, Hiribura Road; Description: Garden; Claimant: 
State; Original Claimant: Madawalamulla South, Hiribura 
Road, No. 394A/1, Kandaddara Badalge Saranapala; 
Extent: About 0.0040 hectare. 

 

05. Lot No. 210 
Name of the land: Not stated; Description: Road; 

Claimant: State; Original Claimant: Madawalamulla 
South, Hiribura Road, No. 394A/1, Kandaddara, Badalge 
Saranapala; Extent: About 0.0034 Hectare. 

 
06. Lot No. 211 
Name of the land: Welaaddara ovita, Kuruduwatta, 

Pashuul ovita; Description: Garden; Claimant: State;  
Original Claimant: In need of the development of Donald 
Janz Cross canal of Moragoda canal; Extent: About 
0.0003 Hectare 

 
All persons interested in the aforesaid land are hereby 

required to appear personally or by agents duly authorized 
in writing before me at the  Four Gravets Galle, Divisional 
Secretariat on 06.06.2018 at 9.00 a.m. and are hereby 
requested to notify to me in writing (in duplicate) on or 
before 30.05.2018 the nature of their interest in the land, 
the particulars of their claims for compensation for the 
acquisition of the said lands, the amount of compensation 
and the details of the computation of such amount. 

 
All deeds and documents in support of the claims 

should be produced before me at the inquiry. 
 

 W.S. Sathyananda, 
 Divisional Secretary, 
 Divisional Secretary's Division,  
 Four Gravets Galle. 
 

Divisional Secretariat, 
Four Gravets Galle. 
 
06-597/3 
 
 
 

THE LAND ACQUISITION ACT(CHAPTER 460) 
 

Notice under Section 7  
 

My Ref. No.: DS/GFG/L&L/5/88. 
Ministry of Land and Parliamentary Reforms Ref No.:  

4 - 3/11/2016/UD/73. 
  
I hereby give notice under Sub-section (1) of Section 7, of 
Land Acquisition Act that the Government intends to 
acquire the following land which is required for a public 
purpose. 
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PRINTED  AT  THE  DEPARTMENT  OF  GOVERNMENT  PRINTING,  SRI  LANKA. 

Six (06) allotments of land in total extent 0.0217 Hectare 
depicted as Lot No 161, 163, 164, 167, 169, & 170 in the 
Sheet No. 01 of Block No. 06 in Cadastral Map No. 
810038 prepared by the Surveyor General situated in the 
village of Dangedara West in the Grama Niladhari 
Division No. 98D of Dangedara West in the Municipal 
Council limit of Galle in the Divisional Secretary’s 
Division of Four Gravets Galle in Galle District of the 
Southern Province and bounded as follows. 
 

Schedule 
01. Lot No. 161 
Name of the land: Not stated; Description: Road; 

Claimant: State; Original Claimant: In need of the 
development of Donaled Janz cross canal of Moragoda 
canal.; Extent: About 0.0023 Hectare. 

 
02. Lot No. 163 
Name of the land: Kokduwawatta; Description: Garden; 

Claimant: State; Original Claimant: In need of the 
development of Donaled Janz cross canal of Moragoda 
canal; Extent : About 0.00047 Hectare. 

 
03. Lot No. 164 
Name of the land: Kosduwawatta, Assessment Number 

449D at Hiribura Road; Description: Garden; Claimant: 
State; Original Claimant: Dangedara West, Hiribura Road, 
449D, Ukwatta Kankanamge Harith Ruwan Ranasinghe; 
Extent: About 0.0095 Hectare 

 
04. Lot No. 167 
Name of the land: Could not be traced; Description: 

Garden; Claimant: State; Original Claimant: Could not be 
traced; Extent: About 0.0047 Hectare. 

05. Lot No. 169 
Name of the land: Kosduwawatta, Assessment Number 

453/15 at Hiribura Road; Description: Garden; Claimant: 
State; Original Claimant: Dangedara West, Hiribura 
Road, 353/15, Diyunuge Ravindralal Shyaman Somasiri; 
Extent: About 0.0018 Hectare. 

 
06. Lot No. 170 
Name of the land: Kosduwawatta, assessment number 

2G at Donaled Janz Road; Description: Garden; 
Claimant: State; Original Claimant: Dangedara West, 
Donaled Janz Road, No. 2G, Janaki Kumudi Paranavitana 
and Sedaraliyanage Siripala; Extent: About 0.0030 
Hectare. 
 
All persons interested in the aforesaid lands are hereby 
required to appear personally or by agents duly 
authorized in writing before me at the  Four Gravets 
Galle, Divisional Secretariat on 06.06.2018 at 9.00 a.m. 
and are hereby requested to notify to me in writing  
(in duplicate) on or before 30.05.2018 the nature of their 
interest in the land, the particulars of their claims for 
compensation for the acquisition of the said lands, the 
amount of compensation and the details of the 
computation of such amount. 
 
All deeds and documents in support of the claims should 
be produced before me at the inquiry. 
 

 W.S. Sathyananda, 
 Divisional Secretary, 
 Divisional Secretary's Division,  
 Four Gravets Galle. 
 

Divisional Secretariat, 
Four Gravets Galle. 
 
06-597/4 

 
 
 
 
  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 


