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No. 2441/30 –  THURSDAY, JUNE 19,  2025 

EXTRAORDINARY 

LAND ACQUISITION ACT (CHAPTER 460)  
 
 

Notice under Section 7 
 

My No.: බිය3/1/1/504. 
 

I hereby give notice under Sub-section (1) of Section 7 of 
the Land Acquisition Act, as amended by the Land, 
Acquisition (Amendment) Act No. 28 of 1964, that the 
Government intends to acquire the following land/
servitude for public purpose. 
 

Description of the land to be acquired:- 
  
All that allotment of land in total extent of about 

0.1381 hectare, depeicted as lot No. 01 in the preliminary 
plan dated 23.12.2024 and block No. 6, Cadastral Map 
No. 512405, prepared by the Superintendent of Surveys, 
situated at the Village Bollegala, No. 278/A, in Adhikari 
Pattuwa, in the Divisional Secretary's Division of  
Biyagama in Gampaha District, Western Province and 
bounded as follows: 

 

Lot No. 01  
Name of the Land: Pelawatta; Description: Road; 

Claimant: Somalatha Gunasekara, No. 346, Manelwatta 
Road, Bollegala; Extent: 0.1381 Hectare.(0 Ac. 1 Ro. 
14.6 Perches) 

All persons who claim ownership, interest or any other 
connection to the aforesaid land, servitude hereby 
required to appear personally, or by agents duly 
authorized in writing, before me on the following days 
and time at the Divisional Secretariat, Biyagama. 

 
Date Lot No. Time 
 

28.07.2025 01 10.00 a.m. 
 
And further, you are hereby requested to notify me in 

writing in duplicate before the 21.07.2025 the nature of 
their interests in the land/lands, the particulars of their 
claims for compensation for the acquisition of the said 
land/servitude, the amount of compensation and the 
details of the computation of such amount. 

 
 S. A. C  S , 
 Divisional Secretary, 
 Biyagama. 
 
At the Divisional Secretariat, 
Sapugaskanda, 
Makola. 
18th June, 2025 
 
EOG 06 - 0168 
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Errata 
 

LAND ACQUISITION ACT (CHAPTER 460)  
 

Notice under Section 7 
 

My No.: බිය3/1/1/502. 
 

The allotments of land Lot Nos. 02 and 04 in the 
Preliminary Plan dated 12.12.2023 and Block No. 02 in 
the Cadastral Map No. 512422 mentioned in the 
notification published in the Gazette Extraordinary  of the 
Democratic Socialist Republic of Sri Lanka No. 2388/13 
and dated 11th June 2024, should be amended to read as 
follows: 
 

Lot No. 02  
Name of the Land: Deewela Kumbura; Description: 

Paddy field; Claimant: P. D. Vineetha Dayakanthi and 
others, No. 87/11, Mabima, Heiyanthuduwa; Extent: 
0.0067 Hectare. (0 Ac. 0 Ro. 2.6 Perches) 

 
Lot No. 04  
Name of the Land: Deewela Kumbura; Description: 

Paddy field; Claimant: L. S. Piyasena and others,                   
No. 109/2, Mabima, Heiyanthuduwa; Extent: 0.0077 
Hectare. (0 Ac. 0 Ro. 3.0 Perches) 

All persons who claim ownership, interest or any other 
connection to the aforesaid land, servitude hereby 
required to appear personally, or by agents duly 
authorized in writing, before me at 10.00 a.m. on 
28.07.2025 at the Divisional Secretariat, Biyagama. 

 
Further, you are hereby requested to notify me in 

writing in duplicate before the 21.07.2025 the nature of 
their interests in the land/lands, the particulars of their 
claims for compensation for the acquisition of the said 
land/servitude, the amount of compensation and the 
details of the computation of such amount. 

 
 S. A. C  S , 
 Divisional Secretary, 
 Biyagama. 
 
At the Divisional Secretariat Biyagama, 
Sapugaskanda, 
Makola. 
18th June, 2025 
 
EOG 06 - 0169 


