
1I ï¨å´Ì :  (I) ï¯¼Æ  - Êòé Èâ¨å Àò°åºå¾àºòè¨ ÌÄå°Éå¼û °¾Ç°ïÆà ªæÌ� ÀºòÆ - 2007.01.05
PART  I :  SEC.  (I) – GAZETTE OF THE DEMOCRATIC SOCIALIST REPUBLIC OF SRI LANKA – 05.01.2007

IMPORTANT NOTICE REGARDING ACCEPTANCE OF NOTICES
 FOR PUBLICATION IN THE WEEKLY "GAZETTE"

ATTENTION is drawn to each  of the Notices appearing in the 1st week of every month, regarding the latest dates and time of acceptance
of notices for publication in the weekly Gazette  at the end of each Part of the Gazette of the Democratic Socialist Republic of Sri Lanka.

All notices to be published in every Part of the Gazette shall close at 12 noon of each Friday, a fortnight before the date of
publication. All Departments, Corporations, Boards, etc.,  are advised that any notification fixing specific dates for closing times of
applications  in regard to vacancies, tender notices and the dates and times of auction sales, etc.,   should be prepared with due regard
to this change, i.e. by  giving adequate time both from the time of despatch of notice  to the Government Press and from the date of
publication thus enabling those interested in the contents of the notices to actively and positively participate.

All notices to be published in the weekly Gazette  should reach this Department positively by 12 noon of the Friday, two
weeks prior to date of publication e.g., Notices for publication in the weekly Gazette of  12th  January, 2007  should reach the Government
Press on or before 12  noon on 29th December, 2006.

LAKSHMAN   GOONEWARDENA ,
Government Printer.

Department of Govt. Printing,
Colombo 08,
January 01, 2007.

The Gazette of the Democratic Socialist Republic of Sri Lanka

1

(Published by Authority)

PART I : SECTION (I) – GENERAL
(Separate paging is given to each language of every Part in order that it may be filed separately)

¡â¨ 1,479 _ 2007 °¾ÉåÖ 05 Éæ¾ø  Ìè¨ëÇå¼å _ 2007.01.05
No. 1,479 – FRIDAY,  JANUARY 05,  2007

PAGE

Government Notifications … … 02
Price Control Orders … … —
Central Bank of Sri Lanka Notices… … —
Accounts of the Government of Sri Lanka … —
Revenue and Expenditure Returns… … —
Miscellaneous Departmental Notices … 08
Notice to Mariners … … —
“Excise Ordinance” Notices … … —

PAGE

Proclamations, &c., by the President … —
Appointments, &c., by the President … —
Appointments, &c., by the Cabinet of Ministers … —
Appointments, &c., by the Public Service Commission —
Appointments, &c., by the Judicial Service Commission ––
Other Appointments, &c.          … … —

Appointments, &c., of Registrars … —

Êòé Èâ¨å Àò°åºå¾àºòè¨ ÌÄå°Éå¼û °¾Ç°ïÆà ªæÌ� ÀºòÆ
N.B.— Part I/IIA and Part IV(A) of the Gazette No. 1,478 of 29.12.2006  were not published.



I ï¨å´Ì :  (I) ï¯¼Æ  - Êòé Èâ¨å Àò°åºå¾àºòè¨ ÌÄå°Éå¼û °¾Ç°ïÆà ªæÌ� ÀºòÆ - 2007.01.05
PART  I :  SEC.  (I) – GAZETTE OF THE DEMOCRATIC SOCIALIST REPUBLIC OF SRI LANKA – 05.01.2007

2

Government Notifications
ANTIQUTIES ORDINANCE (CHAPTER 188)

Notice under Section 19

Notice is hereby given by the Minister of Cultural  Affairs and
National Heritage that it is intended to make an Order under Section
19 of the Antiquities  Ordinance (Chapter 188), declaring the
monuments se Out below, to be Protected monuments for the
purpose of the aforesaid Ordinance.

List of Monuments to be Declard as Protected Monuments

1. Cave with drip ledges inscription and two ancient ponds in
the premises of Nikasala Aranaya Senasana in the Village of
Kanduboda in Gramaniladhari division Kandemadagama in
the divisional secretariat division of Hettipola in the
Kurunegala district, North western province.

2. Ancient Dagaboa mound, poya geya and  the land with
stone pillars in the Pansal Hena Watta in the village of
Nikapitiya in the Gramaniladahaeri division of Hiripokuna
in the divisional secretariat of Hettipola Kurunegala district
North Western Province.

3. Ancient Dagaboa mound two ancient buildings and the pond
belonging to the Weheragala temple premises in the village
of Galkanda in Gramaniladhari division Munigirigama in the
divisional secretariat division of Hettipola in Kurunegala
district North Western Province.

4. Dagaboa, Bodhigaraya two conserved buildings temple with
dripledges, cave with letter and the archaeological remains
scattered in the vicinity belonging to the premises of
Kandemedagama Mahachethiyagiri Vihara in the
Gramaniladhari division of Kandemdegama in the divisional
secretariat division of Hettipola, Kurunegala district, North
Western province.

5. Wijaya cemetery sitituated in  Medagama Kanda in the
gramaniladhari division of Kandemedagama in the divisional
secretariat division of Hettepola, Kurunegala district North
Western Province.

6. Dagaboa mound and the remains belonging to tampita
viharaya situated above the boundry of Bathalagoda wewa
Bamunumulla in the gramaniladhari division of Bamunumulla
in the divisional secretariat division of Hettipola, Kurunegala
district, North Western province.

7. Cave temple with dripledgs and the ancient rampart belonging
to ancient Walagamba vihara premises situated in the
gramaniladhari division Malagane in the divisional secretariat
division of Wariyapola, Kurunegala district North Western
Province.

8. The foundation of the ancient dagaboa Asanagaraya, ancient
inscriptions, caves with Brahmi characters and cave temple

belonging to Nuwara Kandapurana temple situated in  the
gramaniladhari division Netiya in the Divisional Secretariat
Division of Wariyapola, Kurunegala district, North Western
province.

9. Nahalla ancient ambalama (resting place) situated in Nahalla
Gramaniladhari division bearing number 604 in Ridigama
divisional secretariat division Kurunegala district North
Western province.

10. Five (5) cave temples with dripledges rock inscriptions and
stone pillers in Polkumbura Sagallipura purana vihara in the
gramaniladhari division of Nahalla bearing no 604 in Ridigama
divisional secretariat division Kurunegala district, North
Western Province.

11. Ancient image house in premises of Delwita Purana vihara
premises in the gramaniladhari division of Delvita bearing
number 569 in Ridigama divisional secretariat division
Kurunegala district, North Western Province.

12. Ancient image house and 03 caves with dripledges belonging
to the premises of Panagamuwa Bambaruwa purana vihara
in the gramaniladhari division of Panagamuwa in the divisional
secretariat division of Ridigama, Kurunegala district, North
Western province.

13. Chethiya mound and stone pillers belonging to Weragoda
Purana vihara premises in the Ganegoda Gramaniladhari
division, in Ridigama divisional secretariat division
Kurunegala district North Western Province.

14. Chethiya mound, Stone pilers, inscription and steps carved
in the rock belonging to Valgamvehera purana vihara in the
gramaniladhari division of Pahala Ogodapola in the divisional
secretariat division of Ridigama Kurunegala district North
Western Province.

15. Inscription, ancient dageboa and archeological remains of in
the vicinity belonging to Vilgam vehera ancient vihara
premises in the village of Padeniya in the Gramaniladhari
division of Mahawela bearing number 586 in Ridigama
divisional secretariat division Kurunegala district, North
Western province.

16. Alawala inscription belonging to the Alawala village situated
at Akkara Panaha gramaniladhari division bearing number
624 in the divisional secretariat division of Ridigama
Kurunegala district, North Western province.

17. Four (4) Inscriptions and five caves with dripledges and
other archaeological remains belonging to Pethmagayaya
archaeological site situated at Rambadagalla gramaniladhari
division bearing number 603 in Ridigama divisional secretariat
division Kurunegala district, North Western province.

18. Kottanga Inscriptions belonging to Kottanga village in
Ogodapola in the gramaniladhari division of Ogodapola



3I ï¨å´Ì :  (I) ï¯¼Æ  - Êòé Èâ¨å Àò°åºå¾àºòè¨ ÌÄå°Éå¼û °¾Ç°ïÆà ªæÌ� ÀºòÆ - 2007.01.05
PART  I :  SEC.  (I) – GAZETTE OF THE DEMOCRATIC SOCIALIST REPUBLIC OF SRI LANKA – 05.01.2007

bearing number 601 in the divisional secretariat division of
Ridigama Kurunegala district, North Western Province.

19. Ancient sthuupa remains of buildings belonging to Sri
Visudharama purana vihara premises in the gramaniladhari
division of Katuhena bearing number 539 in the divisional
secretariat division of Ridigama Kurunegala district, North
Western province.

20. Tempita vihara degeba in the Poya Seema of Wathuwaththa
Sri sunandharama vihara in the gramaniladhari division of
Wathuwaththa in the divisional secretariat division of
Udubadhawa Kurunegala district North Western province.

21. Ancient image house belonging to Horawadunna Sri
Sudharashana Shailabimbarama purana vihara in the
gramaniladhari division of Horawadunna in the Kuliyapitiya
divisional secretariat division, Kurunegala District, North
western province.

22. Tampita vihara in the premises of the Nagarukarama vihara
premises in Kumbukwewa in the gramaniladhari division of
Tissawa in the Katupotha divisional secretariat division,
Kurunegala district North Western province.

23. Cave with dripledges and the Sacred foot print carved on the
rock in Dickgeya and cave with Inscription in the premises
of Rankirimada Rajamaha viharaya Doluwa in the
gramaniladhari division of Doluwa bearing number 489 in
the divisional secretariat division of Ibbagamuwa Kurunegala
district North Western province.

24. Inscription, remains of buildings with foundations of pillars,
stone pillars and ancient dagaboa in the place called Kalugala,
in Bogahamula watta, Bandaragala in the gramaniladhari
division of Bandaragala in the division secretariat division of
Mawathagama, Kurunegala district North Western province.

25. The image house with the paintings of the Kandyan period
of all caves with dripledges and inscriptions, foot print carved
in the rock, stone pillars and dagoba in the premises of
Mangalarama Ganekanda rajamaha vihara premises in the
gramaniladhari division of Saliyagama bearing number 343
in the divisional secretariat division of Polpithigama,
Kurunegala district, North Western province.

26. Cave with dripledges remains of dagoba on the top of the
rock and the other scattered archeological remains belonging
to the premises of Sri Neelagiri Rajamaha vihara in the village
of Kalugalla in the gramaniladhari division of Oaggamuwa in
the divisional secretariat division of  Maspotha, Kurunegala
district, North Western province.

27. The cave with dripledges and dagoba mound in the area with
the stone in the area of lot 80 in the gramaniladhari division
of Henegedara bearing number 267 in the divisional secretariat
division of Rasnayakapura, Kurunegala district North
Western Provicne.

28. Ancient image house belonging to the premises of
Wadakahagala purana vihara in the gramaniladhari division
of Konwewa bearing number 166 in the divisional secretariat
division of Mahawa in the Kurunegala district North Western
province.

29. The area with the very old stone pillars belonging to the
premises of Sakyamuni vihara in the village of Gurugoda in
the gramaniladhari division of Pothuwewa bearing number
206 in divisional secretariat division of Mahawa, Kurunegala
district North Western province.

30. Cave and cave temple with dripledges, two inscriptions and
four roce inscriptions belonging to the premises of
Diyagambe purana vihara in the gramaniladhari division of
Kattambuwawa bearing number 138 in the divisional
secretariat division of Mahawa, Kurunegala district North
Western province.

31. Tampita vihara belonging to the premises of Mahawewa
Nagarama purana vihara in the gramaniladhari division  of
mahawewa bearing number 525 in thedivisional secretariat
division of Mahawewa Puttalam district North Western
province.

32. The official quarters of the administrative officers of the
British period situated in the village of Rajaweediya in the
divisional secretariat division of Matale, Matale district
Central province.

33. The image house and Atuwa situated in Weluwanarama
purana temple premises in the gramaniladhari division of
Pallepola north in the divisional secretariat division of
Pallepola Matale district Central province.

34. Ancient Pinthaliya belonging to the gramaniladhari division
of Nagolla in the divisional secretariat division of Ukuwela,
Matale district Central province.

35. St. Emmanuwal church in the Kottala gramaniladhari  division
in the divisional secretariat division of Hanguranketha
Nuwaraeliya district Central province.

36. Ancient image house and Awasage belonging to Hanthana
Rajamaha vihara in the gramaniladhari division of Udawela
Udagama East in the divisional secretariat division of Patha
Hewaheta Kandy district, Central province.

37. Ancient Dowsan tower situated in the Kadugannawa town
in the gramaniladhari division of Kadugannawa in the
divisional secretariat division of Yatinuwara Kandy district,
Central Province.

38. Cave with dripledges known as Seethalena situated in the
land called Anwilwatta in the gramaniladhari division bearing
number 432 in the divisional secretariat division of Hanwella
Colombo district Western province.



I ï¨å´Ì :  (I) ï¯¼Æ  - Êòé Èâ¨å Àò°åºå¾àºòè¨ ÌÄå°Éå¼û °¾Ç°ïÆà ªæÌ� ÀºòÆ - 2007.01.05
PART  I :  SEC.  (I) – GAZETTE OF THE DEMOCRATIC SOCIALIST REPUBLIC OF SRI LANKA – 05.01.2007

4

39. Two caves with dripledges in the udamaluwa and the ancient
awasage in the pahatha maluwa of Embulgama raja Maha
viharaya situated in the gramaniladhari division of Henpita
in the divisional secretariat division of Homagama, Colombo
district, Western province.

40. The natural cave with characteristics of pre-historic human
settlements in the Kurunegala mountain in the gramaniladhari
division of Kuragala in the divisional secretariat division of
Padukka, Colombo district, Western province.

41. The buirial place of the person named Hussein Lebbe and
the tomb of person called Masthan Mawlana and the
octagonal tomb in the Maligawatta Muslim cemetery in the
gramaniladhari division of Maligawatta in the divisional
secretariat division of Colombo central, Colombo district,
Western province.

42. Old house situated in the land called Bans hall in Bans place
in the divisional secretariat division of Thimbirigasyaya,
Colombo district, Western Province.

43. The place with the remains of buildings foundation pits on
the rock surface in the mountain called Bulathwathukanda
in Lower Kudaligama gramaniladhari division bearing number
817A in the divisional secretariat division of Bulathsinhala,
Kaluthara district, Western province.

44. Ancient image house belonging to Pawrekanda purana vihara
situated in the top of Halwala kanda in the gramaniladhari
division of Halwala in the divisional secretariat division of
Agalawatta, Kaluthara district, Western province.

45. Image house belonging to Sri Prabodharama purana vihara in
the gramaniladhari division of Girikuluwa in the division
secretariat division of Merigama, Gampaha district, Western
province.

46. Cave with dripledges, pond, steps and the inscriptions
belonging to Ganeuda raja maha vihara in the village of
Samanabedda in the gramaniladhari division of Samanabedda
bearing number 416A in the divisional secretariat division of
Dompe, Gampaha district, western province.

47. Ancient image house belonging to Kottamba Sri
Subadhrarama temple in the gramaniladhari division of
Henatigahamuna in the divisional secretariat division of
Okewela, Hambanthota district, Southern province.

48. Ancient Building (Aarachchi Walawwe) bearing assessment
number 26 in Dharmapala mawatha Bazzar East
gramaniladhari division of Bazaar East in the divisional
secretariat division of Matara district southern province.

49. Ancient Rampart and  ammunition store close to Matara
Star fort in the Uyanwatta gramaniladhari division in the
divisional secretariat division of Matara, Matara district,
southern province.

50. Ancient Building Called “Rendagedara” bearing assesssment
number 40 in  Devinuwara Sinhasana Mawatha in the
gramaniladhari division of bearing number 433c in the
divisional secretariat division of Devinuwara, in the Matara
district, southern province.

51. Ancient image house belonging to Weligama Kowilakanda
purana vihara premises situated in the gramaniladhari division
of Palalla in the divisional secretariat division of Welipitiya,
Matara District, Southern province.

52. Image house, bana preaching hall, dagoba, pond and the
pillar inscription in the Ganegoda Raja maha vihara in the
gramaniladhari division of Elpitiya Central bearing number
25 in the divisional secretariat division of Elpitiya, Galle
district, Southern province.

53. Rumaswela ancient tower in Bonavista in the gramaniladhari
division belonging No.137B Habaraduwa divisional
secretariat division-Galle district, Southern province.

54. Cave temple with dripledges and ancient dagoba belonging
to Gonapenuwala sri Sailakutarama purana Gallen Vihara in
Waulagala gramaniladhari division in the divisional secretariat
division of Beddegama, Galle district, Southern province.

55. Kathuwa Atadage walawwa and Boundry Wall in Kathaluwa
East gramaniladhari division in the divisional secretariat
division of Habaraduwa, Galle district, Southern province.

56. Ancient building bearing assessment number 4 in Rathnapura
Bandaranayake mawatha, situated in Rathnapura town West
gramaniladhari division in Rathnapura divisional secretariat
division, Rathnapura district, Sabaragamuwa province.

57. Ancient building at assessment number 1/1 in Frank
Hettiarachchi mawatha in Rathnapura, Rathnapura town
gramaniladhari division in Rathnapura divisional secretariat
division, Rathnapura district, Sabaragamuwa province.

58. Ancient building at assessment number 58/1 in Rathnapura
Dutch fort in Rathnapura town gramaniladhari division in
divisional secretariat division of Rathnapura, Rathnapura
district, Sabaragamuwa province.

59. Dewalegawa Galkaduwa purana cave temple situated in
Weralupe gramaniladhari division in Rathnapura divisional
secretariat division, Rathnapura District, Sabaragamuwa
province.

60. Cave with dripledges with Brahmee characters (Vidharshana
cave temple) belonging to Walipatha puhulyaya purana cave
temple in Konegasmankada gramaniladhari division in
Balagoda divisional secretariat division, Rathnapura district,
Sabaragamuwa province.



5I ï¨å´Ì :  (I) ï¯¼Æ  - Êòé Èâ¨å Àò°åºå¾àºòè¨ ÌÄå°Éå¼û °¾Ç°ïÆà ªæÌ� ÀºòÆ - 2007.01.05
PART  I :  SEC.  (I) – GAZETTE OF THE DEMOCRATIC SOCIALIST REPUBLIC OF SRI LANKA – 05.01.2007

61. Ancient cave temple and two caves with dripledges in the
premises of Ganelandagama Diyavinna Devagiri Purana
Gallen Vihara in the gramaniladhari division of Diyavinna in
Balangoda divisional secretariat division, Rathnapura district,
Sabaragamuwa province.

62. Ancient image house and Hewisimandapa belonging to
Mahawalathenna Sri Chandrasekara Mudalindarama purana
temple premises in Mahawalathenna gramaniladhari division
in Balangoda divisional secretariat division, Rathnapura
district, Sabaragamuwa province.

63. Cemetery of Maduwanwala family in Dedarangamuwa in
the gramaniladhari division of Maduwanwala in the divisional
secretariat division, Rathnapura district, Sabaragamuwa
province.

64. Ancient dagoba belonging to Dickwelegoda village in
Maduwanwala gramaniladhari division in the divisional
secretariat division of  Kollonne in Rathnapura district,
Sabaragamuwa province.

65. Ancient Buddha image (Aththarama purana vihara) in
Kolonne purana vihara premises in the gramaniladhari division
of Kollonne in the divisional secretariat division of
Rathnapura district, Sabaragamuwa province.

66. Tampita vihara of Kolonne Dapane Sri Jayasundararama
Raja Maha vihara Premises situated in the Gramaniladhari
division of  Dapane  bearing number 210 in Kolonne divisional
secretariat division, Rathnapura district, Sabaragamuwa
province.

67. Ancient vihara mandira of Halvinna Sri Jaya Maha vihara
premises situated in the gramaniladhari division of
Kamburugamuwa bearing number 208 in Kolonne divisional
secretariat division, Rathnapura district, Sabaragamuwa
Province.

68. Image house with ancient sculpture and paintings and the
boundry Wall belonging to Pan  wenna Abayathilakarama
Purana vihara premises in the gramaniladhari divisio of
Kapuhenthota in the divisional secretariat division of
Pelmadulla, Rathnapura district, Sabaragamuwa province.

69. Image house with ancient paintings and sculpture,
Awasageya and boundary wall belonging to Makandura
ancient vihara premises in the gramaniladhari division of
Makandura in the divisional secretariat division of
Godakawela, Rathnapura district, Sabaragamuwa province.

70. Tampita vihara belonging to the premises of Hingula rajamaha
vihara in the gramaniladhari  division of Hugula in the
divisional secretariat division of Mawenella, Kegalle district,
Sabaragamuwa province.

71. Broten bungalow, cattle shed and office building erected  in
the Broten estate in the gramaniladhari division of poonagala
in the divisional secertariat division of  Bandarawela in Badulla
district, Uva province.

72. Caves with drip ledges, rock inscription, and ancient stupa
mound in the village of Veheragala in the gramaniladhari
division of Unuwathurabubula in the divisional secretariat
division, of Mahaoya, Ampara district, Eastern province.

73. Viharageya with ancient paintings and sculpture belonging
to Gothami vihara in the village of Gothamipura  situated in
the gramaniladhari division of Gothamipura bearing number
87 in the divisional secretariat division of Thimbirigasyaya,
Colombo district, Western province.

Objection to the marking of the above must be received by the
Director general of Archaeology, Colombo on or  before 19th January
2007, every such objection must be in writing and contain a statement
of the ground upon which it is made.

MAHINDA  YAPA ABEYWARDANA,
Minister of Cultural Affairs and National Heritage.

06th December 2006.
Colombo.

01-24

CHANGE  OF  VILLAGES  NAMES

IT is hereby notified for general information that village name
appearing in Schedule I has been changed in terms of the name in the
Schedule II.

Dr. SARATH AMUNUGAMA,
Minister of Public Administration and Home Affairs.

Ministry of Public Administration and Home Affairs.
Independence Square,
Colombo 07.
06th December, 2007.

District Divisional Grama Schedule I Schedule II
Secretariat Niladhari

Division

Kurunegala Wariyapola 1241 Radagama Ransirigama
    Ambawa

01-58

-a



I ï¨å´Ì :  (I) ï¯¼Æ  - Êòé Èâ¨å Àò°åºå¾àºòè¨ ÌÄå°Éå¼û °¾Ç°ïÆà ªæÌ� ÀºòÆ - 2007.01.05
PART  I :  SEC.  (I) – GAZETTE OF THE DEMOCRATIC SOCIALIST REPUBLIC OF SRI LANKA – 05.01.2007

6

L.D.B. 132/29(ii)

PUBLIC  SERVICE  MUTUAL  PROVIDENT  ASSOCIATION  ORDINANCE

RULES made by the Public Service Mutual Provident Association, under Section 16 of the Public Service Mutual Provident Association
ordinance (Chapter 283) and approved by the Minister in charge of the subject of Finance.

Secretary,
Ministry of Finance and Planning.

Colombo,
12th December, 2006.

Rules

The rules published in Gazette No. 5147 dated 17th June, 1892 as amended from time to time and last amended by Gazette No. 1341 dated
14th May, 2004 are hereby further amended as follows:

(1) Under the heading Chapter 1 - General Rules

(a) in rule 1 (i) by the substituton for the words and figures “35 years or under” of the words and figures “40 years or
under” ;

(b) by the repeal of rule (1) (i) (a) ;

(c) in rule 1 (ii) by the substitution for the words and figures “35 years or under” of the words and figures “40 years or
under” ;

(d) in rule 13 (ii) under the heading “Loan Entitlement” by the substitution  for items 1 to 7, of the following items :-

“Loan Entitlement

Period of Rate of Contribution Rate of No. of Other
Membership Less than 5% Contribution 5% repayment requirement

or over Instalements

1. A member of Rs.1,500/- Rs. 3,000/- 10 Confirmation
not less than  6 not necessary
months and not more
than 12 months.

2. A member of not Rs. 3,000/- Rs. 5,000/- 20 - do -
less than  1 year
and not more than
3 years.

3. A member of not Two months Three months 48 Should have been
less than  3 years Consolidatede Salary Consolidated Salary confirmed in service
and not more than (maximum (maximum and contributions
5 years Rs. 20,000/-) Rs. 25,000/-) should continue at 5%.

4. A member of not Four months Five months 48 Should have been
less than  5 years Consolidated Salary/ Consolidated Salary/ confirmed in service.
and not more than Pension (maximum Pension (maximum Contribution loan is
7 years Rs. 35,000/-) Rs. 40,000/-) restricted to half  the

amount in credit
Contribution should be
continued at 5%



7I ï¨å´Ì :  (I) ï¯¼Æ  - Êòé Èâ¨å Àò°åºå¾àºòè¨ ÌÄå°Éå¼û °¾Ç°ïÆà ªæÌ� ÀºòÆ - 2007.01.05
PART  I :  SEC.  (I) – GAZETTE OF THE DEMOCRATIC SOCIALIST REPUBLIC OF SRI LANKA – 05.01.2007

5. A member of not Six months Eight months 48
less than  7 years Consolidated Salary/  Pension/Salary
and not more than Pension (maximum
12 years Rs. 50,000/-)

6. A member of more Six months Eight months 48  - do -
than Consolidated Consolidated Salary/  Consolidated
12 years Pension (maximum  Salary/ Pension

Rs. 70,000/-) (maximum Rs. 75,000/-)

7. A member who has Three months Five months 48 Recoveries should be
Retired before Pension (maximum Pension made from the pension.
reaching the age of Rs. 15,000/-) (maximum Rs. 30,000/-) Contribution loan is
55 years and set off restricted to half the
loans against amount in credit.
contribution until he Contribution should be
completes the age continued at 5%.
of 55 years.

8. A Donatory  Member Four months 48 Not entitle to loans
who has not obtained Pension (maximum under Rule 14
loan under Rule 14. Rs. 25,000/-) Instalements to be

recovered from the
pension.”;

(e) in rule 13 (v)(a) by the substitution for the words and figures “in not more than 36 consecutive monthly instalements” of the words
and figures “in not more than forty eight (48) consecutive monthly instalments”;

(f) by the substitution for rule 13C thereof of the following rule :-

“13C. Any member who has completed one year membership may be granted festival loan of Rs. 5,000/= repayable in ten (10)
consecutive monthly instalements” ;

(g) by the insertion immediately after rule 13F of the following new rule :-

13G. Any member who has more than  five years continued membership, may be granted a loan of  not exceeding rupees ten thousand
(Rs. 10,000/- ) in the event of his child having passed the G.C.E. (A/L) Examination . This loan shal be granted upon the production
of a valid certificate issued by a  recognized University or Higher Educational institute of Sri Lanka confirming that such child
is following a course in higher education in such University or Higher Educational Institution. This loan shall be repaid in 36 equal
monthly instalements, at an interest rate of 10 per centum (10%) per annum ;

Provided however that this loan shall be granted only after taking into account the possibility of deducting the instalements from
the monthly salary of the member, subject to the maximum deduction limit of 40% of his monthly salary “ ;

(h) By the insertion immediately after rule 14(2) of the following new rule :-

“14(3) (i) It shall be lawful to grant a donation not exceeding rupees fifty thousand (Rs. 50,000_ to any member who has a valid
membership for more than five years, and where such member is suffering from a serious illness.

(ii) The committee of management shall decide on the granting of a donation to such member upon the production of a
certificate from a Medical Practitioner from a Government  or a recognized Private medical institution.

(iii) A certificate issued by the Medical Practitioner shall state the seriousness of the illness of the member, and recommend
further medical treatment for the cure of such illness.

Period of Rate of Contribution Rate of No. of Other
Membership Less than 5% Contribution 5% repayment requirement

or over Instalments

Should have been
Confirmed is service
Contribution loan is
restricted to half the
amount in credit.
Cozntribution should be
continued at 5%.



I ï¨å´Ì :  (I) ï¯¼Æ  - Êòé Èâ¨å Àò°åºå¾àºòè¨ ÌÄå°Éå¼û °¾Ç°ïÆà ªæÌ� ÀºòÆ - 2007.01.05
PART  I :  SEC.  (I) – GAZETTE OF THE DEMOCRATIC SOCIALIST REPUBLIC OF SRI LANKA – 05.01.2007

8

(iv) It shall be lawful to establish  a fund known as “the Medical Donation Fund” into which every member of the Association
stall credit rupees ten (Rs. 10/ -) every month.”

(i) in rule 15(i), by the substitution for the words “let the amount of the debt be debited to his contributions” of the words “let the
amount of the debt be debited to his contributions, dividends and interest”.

01-41

Miscellaneous Departmental Notices

N (PVS) 36186.

COMPANIES  ACT,  No.  17  OF  1982

Notice under Section 373 (3) to Strike - off the name
Telecom City (Private) Limited

WHEREAS there is reasonable cause to believe that Telecom City
(Private) Limited, a company incorporated on 29.12.2003 under the
provisions of the companies Ordinance Act, is not carrying on
business or in operation.

Now know you that I, Dias Karunaratne Hettiarachchi, Registrar
of Companies, acting under Section 373 (3) of the Companies Act, No.
17 of 1982, do hereby give notice that at the expiration of three months
from this date the name of  Telecom City (Private) Limited will unless
cause is shown to the contrary, be struck  off the Register of
Companies kept in this Office and the Company will be dissolved.

DIAS KARUNARATNA HETTIARACHCHI

Registrar of Companies.

Department of Registrar of Companies,
No. 400, D. R. Wijewardena Mawatha,
Colombo 10,
05th December, 2006.

01-05

THE  STATE  MORTGAGE  AND  INVESTMENT  BANK

Resolution adopted by the Board of Directors under
Section 50 of the State Mortgage and Investment Bank

Law,  No. 13 of 1975 as amended by Act, No. 62 of 1981 and
by Act, No. 29 of 1984

Loan Reference No. :  2/67382/B2/131.

AT the meeting held on 03.05.2006 the Board of Directors of the State
Mortgage and Investment Bank resolved specially and
unanimously :

1. Whereas Keppeti Pathirennehelage Siriwardena and Hapu

Arachchige Indrani Perera of Webada has made default in the

payment due on Mortgage Bond No. 5638 dated 04.12.1999

attested by N. A. Abeyratne,  Notary Public of Colombo  and a

sum of Rupees Three Hundred Seven Thousand Eight Hundred

Fifty One and Cents Eighty Eight (Rs. 307,851.88) is due on

account of Principal and Interest as at 26.03.2006 together with

further interest at Rupees Ninety One and Cents Fifty Two

(Rs. 91.52) per day, till date of full and final settlement, in terms

of Mortgage Bond  No. 5638  aforesaid. (less any payments made

on thereafter).

2. That in terms of Section 50 of the State Mortgage and

Investment Bank Law No. 13 of 1975 and the amendments thereto,

E. Ervin Perera, Licensed Auctioneer of No. 03, Pagoda Road,

Nugegoda,  be authorized and empowered to sell by Public Auction

the property mortgaged to the State Mortgage and Investment

Bank described in the Schedule hereunto for the recovery of the said

sum as mentioned in paragraph one of this notice together with

costs and monies recoverable under Section 57 of the said Law.

SCHEDULE

All that divided and defined allotment of land marked Lot 01

depicted in Plan No. 1255, dated 26.01.1992, made by W. D. N.

Seneviratne, Licensed Surveyor, of the land called Gorakagahawatta

alias Godaparagahawatta, situated at Weboda, within the Pradeshiya

Sahba Limits of Mahara and in the District of Gampaha, and containing

in extent (0A.,0R.,16P.)  together with building everything else

standing thereon.

Together with the right of way marked Lot 4 depicted in Plan No.

1255.

S. A. WEERASINGHE,

 General Manager.

No. 269, Galle Road,

Colombo 03,

22nd December, 2006.

01-125/1



9I ï¨å´Ì :  (I) ï¯¼Æ  - Êòé Èâ¨å Àò°åºå¾àºòè¨ ÌÄå°Éå¼û °¾Ç°ïÆà ªæÌ� ÀºòÆ - 2007.01.05
PART  I :  SEC.  (I) – GAZETTE OF THE DEMOCRATIC SOCIALIST REPUBLIC OF SRI LANKA – 05.01.2007

THE  STATE  MORTGAGE  AND  INVESTMENT  BANK

Resolution adopted by the Board of Directors under
Section 50 of the State Mortgage and Investment Bank

Law,  No. 13 of 1975 as amended by Act, No. 62 of 1981 and
by Act, No. 29 of 1984

Loan Reference No. :  8/73349/Z8/592.

AT the meeting held on 05.10.2006 the Board of Directors of the State
Mortgage and Investment Bank resolved specially and
unanimously :

1. Whereas Moodugamuwe Aratchige Indranee of Galle has
made default in the payment due on Mortgage Bond No. 6801
dated 22.08.2002   attested by C. K. W.  Seneviratne,  Notary Public
of Galle  and a sum of Rupees Four Hundred Forty Seven Thousand
Twenty Two and Cents Eighty Two (Rs. 447,022.82) is due on
account of Principal and Interest as at 25.09.2006 together with
further interest at Rupees One Hundred Sixty Two and Cents
Ninety Seven (Rs. 162.97) per day, till date of full and final
settlement, in terms of Mortgage Bond  No. 6801 aforesaid. (less
any payments made on thereafter).

2. That in terms of Section 50 of the State Mortgage and
Investment Bank Law No. 13 of 1975 and the amendments thereto,
N. H. P. F. Ariyaratne, Licensed Auctioneer of No. 14, Sri
Dhamarama Mawatha, Fort, Matara,  be authorized and empowered
to sell by Public Auction the property mortgaged to the State
Mortgage and Investment Bank described in the Schedule hereunto
for the recovery of the said sum as mentioned in paragraph one of
this notice together with costs and monies recoverable under
Section 57 of the said Law.

SCHEDULE

All that divided and defined allotment of land marked Lot A
depicted in Plan No. 3128, dated 23.01.2002, made by A. N. W.
Liyanage, Licensed Surveyor, of the land called Berugodakanatte
Watta and Dikdeniyewatta, situated at Uluwitike within the Four
Gravets of Galle and in the District of Galle, and containing in extent
(0A.,0R.,23P.)  together with building everything else standing
thereon.

S. A. WEERASINGHE,
 General Manager.

No. 269, Galle Road,
Colombo 03,
22nd December, 2006.

01-125/2

N (PVS) 7362.

COMPANIES  ACT,  No.  17  OF  1982

Notice under Section 373 (3) to Strike-off the Name
Phoenix Packaging (Private) Limited

WHEREAS there is reasonable cause to believe that Phoenix Packaging
(Private) Limited, a company incorporated on 27.02.1991 under the
provisions of the companies Act, is not carrying on business or in
operation.

Now know you that I, Dias Karunaratna Hettiarachchi, Registrar
of Companies, acting under Section 373 (3) of the Companies Act, No.
17 of 1982, do hereby give notice that at the expiration of three months
from this date the name of  Phoenix Packaging (Private) Limited will
unless cause is shown to the contrary, be struck-off the Register of
Companies kept in this Office and the Company will be dissolved.

DIAS KARUNARATNA HETTIARACHCHI

Registrar of Companies.

Department of Registrar of Companies,
No. 400, D. R. Wijewardena Mawatha,
Colombo 10,
05th December, 2006.

01-06

N (PVS) 6241.

COMPANIES  ACT,  No.  17  OF  1982

Notice under Section 373 (3) to Strike-off the Name L. M.
Buying Office (Private) Limited

WHEREAS there is reasonable cause to believe that L. M. Buying
Office (Private) Limited, a company incorporated on 22.03.1990
under the provisions of the companies Act, is not carrying on business
or in operation.

Now know you that I, Dias Karunaratna Hettiarachchi, Registrar
of Companies, acting under Section 373 (3) of the Companies Act, No.
17 of 1982, do hereby give notice that at the expiration of three months
from this date the name of  L. M. Buying Office (Private) Limited will
unless cause is shown to the contrary, be struck-off the Register of
Companies kept in this Office and the Company will be dissolved.

DIAS KARUNARATNA HETTIARACHCHI

Registrar of Companies.

Department of Registrar of Companies,
No. 400, D. R. Wijewardena Mawatha,
Colombo 10,
05th December, 2006.

01-07



I ï¨å´Ì :  (I) ï¯¼Æ  - Êòé Èâ¨å Àò°åºå¾àºòè¨ ÌÄå°Éå¼û °¾Ç°ïÆà ªæÌ� ÀºòÆ - 2007.01.05
PART  I :  SEC.  (I) – GAZETTE OF THE DEMOCRATIC SOCIALIST REPUBLIC OF SRI LANKA – 05.01.2007

10

N (PVS) 8197.

COMPANIES  ACT,  No.  17  OF  1982

Notice under Section 373 (3) to Strike - off the Name
Jayabima Multy Trades (Private) Limited

WHEREAS there is reasonable cause to believe that Jayabima Multy
Trades (Private) Limited, a company incorporated on 07.10.1991
under the provisions of the companies Act, is not carrying on business
or in operation.

Now know you that I, Dias Karunaratna Hettiarachchi, Registrar
of Companies, acting under Section 373 (3) of the Companies Act, No.
17 of 1982, do hereby give notice that at the expiration of three months
from this date the name of  Jayabima Multy Trades (Private) Limited
will unless cause is shown to the contrary, be struck - off the Register
of Companies kept in this Office and the Company will be dissolved.

DIAS KARUNARATNA HETTIARACHCHI

Registrar of Companies.

Department of Registrar of Companies,
No. 400, D. R. Wijewardena Mawatha,
Colombo 10,
05th December, 2006.

01-09

N (PVS) 8235.

COMPANIES  ACT,  No.  17  OF  1982

Notice under Section 373 (3) to Strike - off the Name Atco
Refrigeration Spares (Private) Limited

WHEREAS there is reasonable cause to believe that Atco Refrigeration
Spares (Private) Limited, a company incorporated on 15.10.1991
under the provisions of the companies Act, is not carrying on business
or in operation.

Now know you that I, Dias Karunaratna Hettiarachchi, Registrar
of Companies, acting under Section 373 (3) of the Companies Act, No.
17 of 1982, do hereby give notice that at the expiration of three months
from this date the name of  Atco Refrigeration Spares (Private) Limited
will unless cause is shown to the contrary, be struck-off the Register
of Companies kept in this Office and the Company will be dissolved.

DIAS KARUNARATNA HETTIARACHCHI

Registrar of Companies.

Department of Registrar of Companies,
No. 400, D. R. Wijewardena Mawatha,
Colombo 10,
05th December, 2006.

01-10

N (PBS) 305.

COMPANIES  ACT,  No.  17  OF  1982

Notice under Section 373 (3) to Strike - off the Name Agro
Technica Marketing (Private) Limited

WHEREAS there is reasonable cause to believe that Agro Technica
Marketing (Private) Limited, a company incorporated on 02.12.1991
under the provisions of the companies Act, is not carrying on business
or in operation.

Now know you that I, Dias Karunaratna Hettiarachchi, Registrar
of Companies, acting under Section 373 (3) of the Companies Act, No.
17 of 1982, do hereby give notice that at the expiration of three months
from this date the name of  Agro Technica Marketing (Private) Limited
will unless cause is shown to the contrary, be struck - off the Register
of Companies kept in this Office and the Company will be dissolved.

DIAS KARUNARATNA HETTIARACHCHI

Registrar of Companies.

Department of Registrar of Companies,
No. 400, D. R. Wijewardena Mawatha,
Colombo 10,
05th December, 2006.

01-11

THE  STATE  MORTGAGE  AND  INVESTMENT  BANK

Resolution adopted by the Board of Directors under
Section 50 of the StateMortgage and Investment Bank Law,

No. 13 of 1975 as amended by Act, No. 62 of 1981 and by
Act, No 29 of 1984

Loan Reference No. : 1/38138/CD5/530.

AT the meeting held on 20th February, 2006 the Board of Directors
of the State Mortgage and Investment Bank resolved specially and
unanimously :

1. Whereas, Hitinayake Mudiyanselage Indrapala of
Kaduwela has made default in the payment due on Mortgage
Bond No. 8241 dated 15th November, 1999 attested by
M. Sabaratnam, Notary Public of Colombo and a sum of Rupees
Two Hundred Forty Thousand Fifty and Cents Ten
(Rs. 240,050.10) is due on account of Principal and Interest as at
09th January, 2006 together with further interest at Rupees
Eighty-five and Cents Fourty-four (Rs. 85.44) per day, till date
of full and final settlement, in terms of Mortgage Bond No. 8241
aforesaid (less any payments made on thereafter).

2. That in tems of Section 50 of the State Mortgage and
Investment Bank Law, No. 13 of 1975 and the amendments thereto
M. Samaranayake, Licensed Auctioneer of No. 145, High Level
Road, Pannipitiya, be authorized and empowered to sell by Public



11I ï¨å´Ì :  (I) ï¯¼Æ  - Êòé Èâ¨å Àò°åºå¾àºòè¨ ÌÄå°Éå¼û °¾Ç°ïÆà ªæÌ� ÀºòÆ - 2007.01.05
PART  I :  SEC.  (I) – GAZETTE OF THE DEMOCRATIC SOCIALIST REPUBLIC OF SRI LANKA – 05.01.2007

Auction the property mortgaged to the State Mortgage and
Investment Bank described in the Schedule hereto for the recovery
of the said sum as mentioned in paragraph one of this notice
together with costs and monies recoverable under Section 57 of
the said Law.

SCHEDULE

All that divided and defined allotment of land marked Lot 3
depicted in Plan No. 836A dated 07th December, 1998 made by Y. P.
de Silva, Licensed Surveyor of the land called Lot1 of and Eastern
portion of Batadombagahawatta, bearing Assessment No. 50/3,
Rassapana Road, situated at the Eastern side of the Road from Main
Road to Malwana at Bomiriya, within the Pradeshiya Sabha Limits
of Kaduwela, Sub-Office of Kaduwela and in the District of Colombo
and containing in extent (0A., 0R., 10P.) together with everything
else standing thereon.

Together with the right of way over and along Lot 1 (Road)
depicted in Plan No. 836 A aforesaid and Lot 2 in Plan No. 836 dated
03rd November, 1998 made by Y. P. de Silva, Licensed Surveyor.

S. A. WEERASINGHE,
General Manager.

No. 269, Galle Road,
Colombo 03,
22nd December, 2006.

01-125/3

THE  STATE  MORTGAGE  AND  INVESTMENT  BANK

Resolution adopted by the Board of Directors under
Section 50 of the StateMortgage and Investment Bank Law,

No. 13 of 1975 as amended by Act, No. 62 of 1981 and by
Act, No 29 of 1984

Loan Reference No. : 1/29987/CD1/507.

AT the meeting held on 15th June, 2005 the Board of Directors of
the State Mortgage and Investment Bank resolved specially and
unanimously :

1. Whereas, Jagath Rohan Weerasinghe and Nirupa
Swarnamalee Manage Weerasinghe of Panniptiya have made
default in the payment due on Mortgage Bond No. 1160 dated
15th October, 1996 attested by I. D. Gunawardena, Notary Public
of Colombo and a sum of Rupees One Hundred Thirty-six
Thousand Three Hundred Forty-nine and Cents Sixty-seven
(Rs. 136,349.67) is due on account of Principal and interest as at
17th May, 2005 together with further interest thereafter as at
Rupees Fifty-eight and Cents Nineteen (Rs. 58.19) per day, till
date of full and final settlement, in terms of Mortgage Bond No.
1160 aforesaid (less any payments made on thereafter).

2. That in terms of Section 50 of the State Mortgage and
Investment Bank Law, No. 13 of 1975 and the amendments thereto
M. Samaranayake, Licensed Auctioneer of No. 145, High Level
Road, Pannipitiya, be authorized and empowered to sell by Public
Auction the property mortgaged to the State Mortgage and
Investment Bank described in the Schedule hereunto for the
recovery of the said sum as mentioned in paragraph one of this
notice together with costs and monies recoverable under Section
57 of the said Law.

SCHEDULE

All that divided and defined allotment of land marked Lot 115A
depicted in Plan No. 6471 dated 14th May, 1991 made by
W. Seneviratne, Licensed Surveyor being a sub-division of the land
called Kottawa Estate alias Sirimalwatta Estate situated at Kottawa
village in the District of Colombo and containing in extent (0A., 0R.,
8.06P.) according to the said Plan No. 6471, together with the buildings,
trees, plantations and everything else standing thereon.

S. A. WEERASINGHE,
General Manager.

No. 269, Galle Road,
Colombo 03,
22nd December, 2006.

01-125/4

N (PVS) 6961.

COMPANIES  ACT,  No.  17  OF  1982

Notice under Section 373 (3) to Strike Off the name Alufab
Hardware (Private) Limited

WHEREAS there is reasonable cause to believe that Alufab Hardware
(Private) Limited, a company incorporated on 08.11.1990 under the
provisions of the companies Act, is not carrying on business or in
operation.

Now know you that I, Dias Karunaratne Hettiarachchi, Registrar of
Companies, acting under Section 373 (3) of the Companies Act, No.
17 of 1982, do hereby give notice that at the expiration of three months
from this date the name of  Alufab Hardware (Private) Limited will
unless cause is shown to the contrary, be struck off the Register of
Companies kept in this Office and the Company will be dissolved.

DIAS KARUNARATNA HETTIARACHCHI,
Registrar of Companies.

Department of Registrar of Companies,
No. 400, D. R. Wijewardena Mawatha,
Colombo 10,
05th December, 2006.

01-08



I ï¨å´Ì :  (I) ï¯¼Æ  - Êòé Èâ¨å Àò°åºå¾àºòè¨ ÌÄå°Éå¼û °¾Ç°ïÆà ªæÌ� ÀºòÆ - 2007.01.05
PART  I :  SEC.  (I) – GAZETTE OF THE DEMOCRATIC SOCIALIST REPUBLIC OF SRI LANKA – 05.01.2007

12

NEW SCALES OF CHARGES FOR NOTICES AND ADVERTISEMENTS IN THE
 "GAZETTE OF THE DEMOCRATIC SOCIALIST REPUBLIC OF SRI LANKA"

EFFECTIVE AS FROM JANUARY  01, 1995

(Issued every Friday)

1. All notices and Advertisements are published at the risk of the Advertisers.

2. All notices and Advertisements by Private Advertisers may be handed in or sent direct by post together with full payments
to the Government Printer, Government Press, Colombo 8.

3. The office hours are from 9.00 a.m. to 4.45 p.m.

4. Cash transactions will be from 9.30 a.m. to 3.30 p.m.

5. All Notices  and  Advertisements must be pre-paid. Notices and Advertisements sent direct by post should be accompa-
nied by Money order, Postal Order or Cheque made payable to the Government Printer. Postage stamps will not be accepted in
payment of Advertisements.

6. To avoid errors and delay "copy"  should be on one side of the paper only and typewritten.

7. All signatures should be repeated in block letters below the written signature.

8. Notices re-change of name from Non-Government Servants and Trade Advertisements are not accepted for publication.

9. Advertisements purporting to be issued under Orders of Courts will not be inserted unless signed or attested by a Proctor
of the Supreme Court.

10. The authorised scale for charges for notices and Advertisements is as follows from January 01, 1995 :–

Rs. c.
One inch or less 51 0
Every addition inch or fraction thereof 51 0
One column or 1/2 page of Gazette 504 0
Two columns or one page of Gazette 1,008 0

All fractions of an inch will be charged for at the full inch rate.

11. The "Gazette of the Democratic Socialist Republic of Sri Lanka" is published every Friday. Day of publication is
subject to alteration in any week where Public Holidays intervene.

12. All Notices and Advertisements should reach the Government Printer, Government Press, Colombo 8, as shown in
schedule of Separate Notice published at the end of each part of the Gazette  of the first week of every month.

13. * REVISED SUBSCRIPTION RATES EFFECTIVE FROM JANUARY 1ST 1995

(Govt. Gazette Annual)

Local Foreign
     Rs. c.       Rs. c.

Whole of Part I (3 sections together) 1,612 0 2,098 0
Parts II to VI (Each Part) 572 0 745 0
Section I 520 0 1,007 0
Section II (Advertising, Vacancies, Tenders Examinations etc.) 624 0 1,009 0
Section III 468 0 907 0
Extraordinary Gazette 3,360 0 4,422 0

Subscription to the “Gazette of the Democratic Socialist Republic of Sri Lanka” are booked per periods of not less than 12
months so as to terminate at the end of a calendar year only.

* Rates for Single Copies if available in stock

Price Postage (Local)
  Rs. c.   Rs. c.

(A) Part I 31 0 5 0
Parts II to VI (Each Part) 11 0 5 0

(B) Section I 10 0 5 0
Section II 12 0 5 0
Section III 9 0 5 0

All remittances should be made in favour of the Superintendent, Government Publications Bureau, No. 32, Lotus Road,
Colombo 01, who is responsible for booking subscriptions and for sale of single copies.



13I ï¨å´Ì :  (I) ï¯¼Æ  - Êòé Èâ¨å Àò°åºå¾àºòè¨ ÌÄå°Éå¼û °¾Ç°ïÆà ªæÌ� ÀºòÆ - 2007.01.05
PART  I :  SEC.  (I) – GAZETTE OF THE DEMOCRATIC SOCIALIST REPUBLIC OF SRI LANKA – 05.01.2007

IMPORTANT  NOTICE  REGARDING  PUBLICATION   OF  GAZETTE

THE Weekly issue of the Gazette of the Democratic Socialist Republic of Sri Lanka is normally published on
Fridays. If a Friday happens to be a Public Holiday the Gazette is published on the working day immediately preceding
the Friday. Thus the last date specified for the receipt of notices for publication in the Gazette also varies depending
on the incidence of public holidays in the week concerned.

The Schedule below shows the date of publication and the latest time by which notices should be received
for publication in the respective weekly Gazette. All notices received out of times specified below will not be
published. Such notices will be returned to the sender by post for necessary amendment and return if publication
is desired in a subsequent issue of the Gazette. It will be in the interest of all concerned if those desirous of ensuring
the timely publication of notices in the Gazette  make it a point to see that sufficient time is allowed for postal
transmission of  notices to the Government Press.

The Government Printer does not accept payments of subscription for the Government Gazette. Payments
should be made direct to the Superintendent, Government Publications Bureau, No. 32, Lotus Road, Colombo 01.

Note.—Payments for inserting Notices in the Gazette of the Democratic Socialist Republic of Sri Lanka
will be received by the Government Printer and not by the Superintendent, Government Publications Bureau.

The  Schedule

Month Date of Publication Last Date and Time of
Acceptance of Notices for
Publication in the Gazette

JANUARY 05.01.2007 Friday — 22.12.2006 Friday 12 noon
12.01.2007 Friday –– 29.12.2006 Friday 12 noon
19.01.2007 Friday –– 05.01.2007 Friday 12 noon
26.01.2007 Friday –– 12.01.2007 Friday 12 noon

FEBRUARY 02.02.2007 Friday — 19.01.2007 Friday 12 noon
09.02.2007 Friday –– 26.01.2007 Friday 12 noon
15.02.2007 Thursday –– 02.02.2007 Friday 12 noon
23.02.2007 Friday –– 09.02.2007 Friday 12 noon

MARCH 02.03.2007 Friday — 15.02.2007 Thursday 12 noon
09.03.2007 Friday –– 23.02.2007 Friday 12 noon
16.03.2007 Friday –– 02.03.2007 Friday 12 noon
23.03.2007 Friday –– 09.03.2007 Friday 12 noon
30.03.2007 Friday — 16.03.2007 Friday 12 noon

LAKSHMAN  GOONEWARDENA ,
Government Printer.

Department of Government Printing,
Colombo 08,
January 01, 2007.

PRINTED  AT  THE  DEPARTMENT  OF  GOVERNMENT  PRINTING,  SRI  LANKA.


